
POOL CHEMICALS, SUPPLIES & REPAIRS
IFB #17.0014

Pricing firm  7/1/2018 - 6/30/2019
2nd Year

Aquatic Source B & B Pools OP Aquatics

Item Item # Description Est. Annual Qty. Unit Bidder Specified Brand Name Item Number
Unit of Measure (ea, 

box, cs, gal, etc)

Indicate how 
you package 

(ex: 4 gal/case) Unit Cost

Bid 
Exceptions 
(Yes or No)

Bidder Specified Brand 
Name

Item 
Number

Unit of 
Measure 
(ea, box, 
cs, gal, 

etc)

Indicate how 
you package 

(ex: 4 gal/case) Unit Cost
Bid Exceptions (Yes or 
No)

Bidder Specified 
Brand Name

Item 
Number

Unit of 
Measure 
(ea, box, 
cs, gal, 

etc)

Indicate how 
you package 

(ex: 4 
gal/case)  Unit Cost 

Bid Exceptions (Yes or 
No)

1 1/2 Ele Jam Nut 1 Each  no bid

2 84-10020 1/2 in - Close Nipple - 
Sch 80

1 Each 84-10020 each each 2.53$                no bid

3 89-20070 1/4 in. - Tubing Per 
Foot - CP

10 Each 89-20070 per ft per ft 6.38$               Finger Lakes Polyflex 8750-8281 per foot coil 0.33$          No Mullarkey 43075 1 foot per foot 0.57$                  

4 52-99140 1000 Watt Par 64 Lamp 10 Each 52-99140 each each 94.69$             Special order 
& shipping

no bid

5
116

12# Balance Pak 300-
Calcium

19 Each ideal water lardness increaser 
25#

10-08000 each per pail 35.00$             Brand we 
carry

Chlor Guard bag 25lb. 35.00$        No Pool Brite 84343 case 4x10# packs 31.70$                

6
177

12.5% Liquid Chlorine 
(4x1 gal)

502 Gallon 10-03050 gal 4/1 gal /per 
case

3.89$                cs 4gal/case 13.00$        Pool Brite 84820 case 4 gal per 
case

8.22$                  

7
185

25# Balance Pak 100-
Alkalinity

2 Each Ideal - Alk Inc. 25# pail 10-20040 each per pail 34.00$             Brand we 
carry

Proguard Bag 50lb. 34.00$        Pool Brite 84990 each 25# 16.41$                

8
120

25# Chlor Out-CL2 
Neutralizer

10 Each Anhydraous sod thiosulfate 50# 10-03073 each bag 50# bag 89.50$             what we 
carry

Cinderella bag 50lb. 94.00$        Pool Brite 84808 each 25# 33.88$                

9
158

25# Diatomaceous 
Earth

4 Each 25# box D.E. 10-05010 box/ea each 29.97$             what we 
carry

Eagle Pitcher Box 25lb. 26.00$        Buckman's 85998 each 25# bag 6.85$                  

10 25# Oxy-Klear 1 Each 25# Non Chl Shock 10-19035 pail each 95.00$             Swimmers Advantage p8705059n Pail 50lb. 218.00$     Pool Brite 84966 Pail 25# 61.48$                
11 80-06510 3/4" Female - SCH 1 Each 80-06510 each each 6.43$               no bid

12 82-21032 3/4" x 1/2in Reducer - T 
X T Sch 40

1 Each 82-21032 each each 7.51$               no bid

13 400C Link Seal 12 Each 81-12020 per piece each 34.38$             no bid
14 10-23035 ACCUTAB - 55# 240 Each Axial-Accutab blue 10-23035 pail 55# pail each 142.00$           Accutab Pail 55lb. 185.00$     Vantage 84580 Pail 50# 99.00$                

15 10-01000 Acid - Muriatic - Gal 140 Each 10-01000 gal 4/1 gal / per 
case

4.50$               Case 4gal/case 20.00$        Buckman's 84900 case 4 gal per 
case

12.34$                

16 10-01015 Acid Magic - Per Gallon 63 Gallon 10-01015 gal 4/1 gal / per 
case

7.01$               Case 5gal/case 48.00$        Buckman's 84904 case 4 gal per 
case

28.77$                

17 25-25040 Anti-Rattle Clamp 2 Each Dur 25-25040 each each 35.63$             no bid

18 Brass Comp Nuts - 1/4" 2 Each misc each each 12.99$             no bid

19 Brass Ferrules - 1/4" 2 Each NO AWARD no bid

20 39-00103 Cable: Swivel Assy 
Dynamic 35'

1 Each Maytronics 39-00103 each each 454.50$           

we are 
authorized 
repair center 
for MI

Maytronics 81787 each each 283.24$              

21 Calcium Chloride 50# 10 Each Chlor Guard Bag 25lb 35.00$        Buckman's 84799 bag 50# 13.89$                

22
2100

Chemtrol 2100 w/flow 
cell/flow switch 

1 Each Chemtrol special order each each 3,850.00$       PC2100 5,862.00$  Chemtrol 42206 each each 2,527.25$          

23 36-16047 Chemtrol PPM Gel 2 Each Chemtrol 36-16047 each each 115.92$           per each 157.00$     Chemtrol 43189 each each 95.77$                

24 36-16046 Chemtrol PPM 
Membrane

2 Each Chemtrol 36-16046 each each 252.00$           per each 362.00$     Chemtrol 43190 each each 221.11$              

25 25-20000 Clamp - Rails S.S 1 Each Duraflex 25-20000 each each 32.45$             no bid

26 36-16201 Co2 Diffuser Assembly 1 Each Neptune Benson 36-16201 each each 124.15$           Becs Technologies 2210326 60.00$        no bid

27 36-16205 Co2 Flow Meter 3-30 1 Each 36-16205 each each 181.74$           Becs Technologies-5-50 
flow

8060956 200.00$     no bid

28 36-16021 Compression Fitting - 
1/4" MPT x 3/8" Tube

1 Each 36-16021 each each 6.74$               no bid

29 52-99205 Global R-375 Lift 
Battery Cover

1 Each Global 52-99205 each each 39.95$             Special order 
& shipping

GLO-42-0035 351.00$     no bid

30 10-23000 Ideal - Algaecide 60-Qt 24 Each Ideal 10-23000 QT each 22.50$             Algae All 60 23060 quart 24.99$        Pool Brite 84351 case 12x1 qt. 
bottles

130.50$              

31 10-16015 IDEAL - Ph Increaser 
20#

4 Each Ideal 10-16015 pail each 31.20$             Chlor Guard 25lb. 33.00$        Pool Brite 84370 each 20# 15.43$                

32 35-40036 I'Kerrick Valve Rebuild 
Kit

1 Each Axial 35-40036 each each 81.07$             no bid

33 Labor Charge to Install 
New Chemtrol 2100

1 Each
Unable to 
bid, depends 
on install

500.00$     OP Aquatics labor 1 hr per hour 75.00$                

34 52-99141 Lens Gasket for Hydrel 
Lights 

48 Each Hydrel 52-99141 each each 45.00$             no bid

35 35-13060 MA - Drain Valve 1 Each 35-13060 each each 89.73$             no bid

36 39-00361 MU DIAG - 2006 6H EX 1 Each Maytronics 39-00361 each each 381.19$           

we are 
authorized 
repair center 
for MI

Maytronics 81754 each each 250.00$              

37
151

Muriatic Acid (15 gal 
carboy)

870 Gallon 10-07020 59.00$              +25 ref dep 
EPA fee 

Buckman's 84903 each 15 gal drum 43.24$                

38 Obr-3 Pool Enzymes 
Pro 5 gallon pail

1 Pail Great Lakes Bio-Systems 10-23042 5 gal pail each 198.40$           Natural Chemistry 3250 5 gallon 5 gallon 243.00$     Natural Chemistry 84450 Pail 5 gal pail 152.12$              

39 35-20068 Polyflex Tubing - 3/8 
OD x 1/4 ID

4 Foot 35-20068 per ft per ft 2.82$               1 foot 0.55$          DUAL AWARD Mullarkey 43081 1 FOOT per foot 0.55$                  DUAL AWARD

40
129

Polysheen Blue-Clarifer 129 Quart Ideal Water Clrifier 10-19019 qt per qt 7.44$               23721 quart 12.99$        GLB 84048 each QT 8.20$                  

41
Pool Pro 450# Alkalinity 
Increaser (Sodium 
Hydrogen Carbonate)

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid Proguard 50lb bag 34.00$        no bid

42 Pool Pro Calcium 
Increase 25#

1 Each Ideal cale Inc. 10-08000 pail per 25# 35.00$             Chlor Guard
25lb Pail

35.00$        Pool Brite 84344 Pail 25# 18.24$                

43 Pool Pro Super Clarifier 2 Quart Ideal super clarifier 10-19020 qt each 14.00$             Natural Clarifier 23742
quart

14.95$        Sea Klear 84254 Case 12x1 qt. 
bottles

125.00$              

44 10-18505 Powder - DPD - 10 
Grms - R0870

4 Each Taylor Technologies wg 8870 10-18505 bottle each 10.75$             Taylor R0870 10 gram 
Bottle

10.99$        Taylor 82344 Bottle 10 grams 5.07$                  

45
PC2100

PPM Sensor 1 Each no bid-add or replace no bid-add or replace no bid-add or replace
no bid-add or 
replace

 no bid-add or 
replace 

Need more 
info

Chemtrol 42196 each each 1,255.17$          

46 36-16070 Probe - PH - K&E - 
Santa Barbara

1 Each Chemtrol 36-1670 each each 275.00$           Chemtrol 80834 184.00$     Chemtrol 43175 each each 250.00$              

47 39-00469 PS DYN Reset USA 2010 1 Each Maytronics Maytronics 81765 each each 250.00$              

48 10-18310 Reagent #1 1 Each 2 oz Rool 10-18310 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0001 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82300 Bottle .75oz 2.50$                  
49 10-18460 Reagent #10 1 Each R010 2oz 10-18460 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0010 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82330 Bottle .75oz 2.94$                  
50 10-18480 Reagent #11 - 2oz. 1 Each R011 2oz 10-18480 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0011 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 6.99$          Taylor 82334 Bottle 2 oz 5.39$                  
51 10-18500 Reagent #12 - 2oz 2 Each R012 2oz 10-18500 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0012 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 7.99$          Taylor 82337 Bottle 2 oz 3.27$                  
52 10-18330 Reagent #2 1 Each R002 2oz 10-18330 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0002 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82303 Bottle .75oz 3.56$                  
53 10-18340 Reagent #3 1 Each R003 2oz 10-18340 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0003 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82306 Bottle .75oz 3.84$                  
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54 10-18360 Reagent #4 1 Each R004 2oz 10-18360 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0004 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82309 Bottle .75oz 2.73$                  
55 10-18372 Reagent #5 1 Each R005 2oz 10-18372 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0005 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82312 Bottle .75oz 2.40$                  
56 10-18385 Reagent #6 1 Each R006 2oz 10-18385 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0006 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82315 Bottle .75 oz 2.40$                  
57 10-18400 Reagent #7 1 Each R007 2oz 10-18400 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0007 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82318 Bottle .75 oz 2.41$                  
58 10-18420 Reagent #8 1 Each R008 2oz 10-18420 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0008 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82321 Bottle .75oz 2.81$                  
59 10-18440 Reagent #9 1 Each R009 2oz 10-18440 each each 9.00$               Taylor R0009 Bottle 3/4 Oz Bottle 4.49$          Taylor 82324 Bottle .75oz 2.80$                  

60 39-00506 Retrofit for Cable Conn. 
- 3 Pin

1 Each Maytronics

39-00506

each each

6.48$               Maytronics

81684: cable    
81734: 3-pin 
conn each

 81684: $12.00  
81734: $6.00 

61 25-25020 Roller Bearing 2 Each Duraflex Infl 25-25020 each each 34.20$             no bid
62 25-25030 Rubber Bumpers 2 Each Duraflex Infl 25-25030 each each 30.96$             no bid

63
84820

Sanitizer/Pool Brite
41

Case
16-03050 gal 4/1 gal/case 3.89$               Pool Brite 84820 case

4 gal per 
case 8.22$                  

64
84480

Shock 12/1 lb 
bags/Pool Brite

1 Bag
Ideal Sure shoce 10-19040 each 12/1#bags 3.60$               BurnOut 35 1lb bags 12 per case 89.99$        Pool Brite 84480 case 12 per case 24.85$                

65 36-16202 Siemens Co2 Solenois 
Valve ith Fittings

1 Each
36-16202 266.75$           Becs Technologies 110V 250.00$     no bid

66 25-25025 Slide Bearing 2 Each Duraflex Infl 25-25025 each each 29.38$             no bid
67 10-19055 Soda Ash - 50lb 5 Each 10-19055 each each 35.00$             ChlorGuard 25lb 33.00$        BUCKMAN'S 84805 BAG 50# $18.51

68 Sodium Bicarbonate 50 
pound bag

41 Bag
10-23036 each each 34.00$             Proguard bag 50lb 34.00$        

BUCKMAN'S 84798
BAG                                    
50#

$16.61

69 Sodium Hypochlorite 670 Gallon same as #63 - liquid chlorine 
per gallon - or lookin for bulk?

same as #63 - liquid 
chlorine per gallon - or 
lookin for bulk?

same as #63 - liquid 
chlorine per gallon - or 
lookin for bulk?

same as #63 - 
liquid chlorine 
per gallon - or 
lookin for bulk?

 same as #63 - 
liquid chlorine 
per gallon - or 
lookin for bulk? 

same as #63 - 
liquid 
chlorine per 
gallon - or 
lookin for 
bulk?

Case 4 gallons per 
case

13.00$        KA STEEL 83995 GALLON                             PER GALLON  $                  1.31 

70 10-03075 Sodium Thiosulfate - 
50lb

7 Each
10-03075 each each 89.16$             Cinderella bag 50lb 94.00$        

BUCKMAN'S 84806 BAG 50# $26.64

71 36-16128 T Strainer - Screen for - 
S.S. - 1 1/2 in

1 Each
Ipex ss y-strainer screen 11/24 36-16128 each each 36.72$             no bid

72 Taylor CL FAS DP Kit
3

Each
k2006Ktt 10-20015 each each 85.00$             Taylor K2006 95.00$        

TAYLOR 82021 EA                                       
EA

 $                46.63 

73 10-18517 Titration Reagent - 2oz - 
R-0871

2 Each
10-18517 each each 14.00$             Taylor R0871 Bottle 2 oz 13.99$        

TAYLOR 82347 BOTTLE 2 OZ. $6.13

74 36-16116 True Union - Y Check 
Valve 2 in.

1 Each
Ipex 2" Tuy check valve 36-16116 each each 241.18$           no bid

75 10-02200 Zappit 73 - 25# 10 Each Axiall/zappit 73 10-02200 each each 91.00$             Pulsar Power Shock Pail 25lb 79.00$        POOL BRITE 84360 PAIL 25# $51.96

NOTE:  THESE ARE ONLY ESTIMATED QUANTITIES.  WHILE ORDERS ARE NOT GUARANTEED, DISTRICT ORDERS ARE EXPECTED TO EXCEED THESE QUANTITIES.
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